Ember Murphy

From: Heather McCool

Sent: Tuesday, January 27, 2026 4:13 PM

To: Ember Murphy

Subject: Re: RWP1707 25-298 Core spaces HUB

It’s cancelled. We just need to settle the billing.

Get Outlook for iOS

From: EMBER MURPHY <EMURPHY@READWINDOW.COM>
Sent: Tuesday, January 27, 2026 3:22:14 PM

To: Heather McCool <hmccool@readwindow.com>
Subject: RWP1707 25-298 Core spaces HUB

If this job is on hold, could you please change order status to "Order Review Pending"?



